B R R TR

abcaus.in

Tt Fe Ee Tele—(T1)04/0007/2003—19 REGISTERED NO. DL—(N)04/0007/2003—19

a1
The Gazette of IJudia

EXTRAORDINARY

T II—39ve 1
PART II — Section 1

TiUsR ¥ T«
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

T 18] T2 feostt, wifFER, W= 02, 2019/ HIFMA 11, 1940 (IF)
No. 18] NEW DELHI, SATURDAY, MARCH 02, 2019/PHALGUNA 11, 1940 (SAKA)

zq v ¥ fu=r 1w ) ot @ Fored fe 9w otem dehe & v H T W o

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legislative Department)

New Delhi, the 2nd March, 2019/Phalguna 11, 1940 (Saka)

THE AADHAAR AND OTHER LAWS (AMENDMENT)

ORDINANCEF, 2019
NO 9 OF 2019

Promulgated by the President in the Seventieth Year of the Republic of
India.

An Ordinance to amend the Aadhaar (Targeted Delivery of Financial and
~ QOther Subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act, 2016 and further to amend the

Indian Telegraph Act, 1885 and the Prevention of quey-laundering Act, 2002.

WHEREAS the Aadhaar and Other Laws (Amendment) Bill, 2019 was

passed by the House of the People on the 4% day of January, 2019 and is pending
in the Council of States;

AND WHEREAS Parliament is not in session and the President 1s satisfied
that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate
action;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of
article 123 of the Constitution, the President is pleased to promulgate the

following Ordinance:—
PARTI]
PRELIMINARY
1.(7) This Ordinance may be called the Aadhaar and Other Laws Short tite and
(Amendme:m) Ordinance, 2019. - commencement,

(2) It shall come into force at once.




abcaus.in

Amendment of
section 2.

Amendment of
section 3,

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—

PART II
AMENDMENTS TO THE AADHAAR (TARGETED DELIVERY OF
FINANCIAL AND OTHER SUBSIDIES, BENEFITS AND SERVICES)
ACT, 2016

2. In section 2 of the Aadhaar (Targeted Delivery of Financial and Other

Subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act, 2016 (hereafter in this Part referred to as
the principal Act),—

(4) for clause (), the following clause shall be substituted, namely: —

‘(@) “Aadhaar number” means an identification number issued to
an individual under sub-section (3) of section 3, and includes any

alternative virtual identity generated under sub-section (4) of that
section;’;

{(if) after clause (a), the following clause shall be inserted, namely—

‘(ag) “Aadhaar ecosystem” includes enrolling agencies,
Registrars, requesting entities, offline verification-seeking entities and

any other entity or group of entities as may be specified by
regulations;’;

(iii) after clause (b), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(ba) “Adjudicating Officer” means an adjudicating officer
appointed under sub-section (/) of section 33B:

(0b) “Appellate Tribunal” means the Appellate Tribunal referred
to In sub-section (1) of section 33C;’;

(iv) after clause (i), the following clause shall be inserted, namety:—

‘(ia) “child” means a person who has not completed eighteen years
of age;”;

(v) after clause {p), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

‘(pa) “offline verification” means the process of verifying the
identity of the Aadhaar number holder without authentication, through
such offline modes as may be specified by regulations;

(pb) “offline verification-secking entity” means any entity

desirous of undertaking offline verification of an Aadhaar number
holder;’.

3. In section 3 of the principal Act, after sub-section (3), the foll owmg sub-

section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(4) The Aadhaar number issued to an individual under sub-section (3)

shall be a twelve-digit identification number and any alternative virtual
identity as an alternative to the actual Aadhaar number of an individual that

shall be generated by the Authority in such manner as may be specified by
regulations.”.

18 of 2016.




abcaus.in

Sec. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY 3

4. After section 3 of the principal Act, the following section shail be lusertion of new
inserted, namely:— section 3A.

“3A.{!) The enrolling agency shﬁll, at the time of enrolment of a child, ~Aadhaar number of
seek the consent of the parent or guardian of the child, and inform the parent ~ children.
or guardian, the details specified under sub-section (2) of section 3.

(2} A child who 1s an Aadhaar number holder may, within a period of
six months of attaining the eighteen years of age, make an application to the
Authority for cancellation of his Aadhaar number, in such manner as may

be specified by regulations and the Authority shall cancel his Aadhaar
number.

(3} Notwithstanding anything in section 7, a child shall not be denied
any subsidy, benefit or service under that section it case of failure to
establish his identity by undergoing authentication, or furnishing proof of
possession of Aadhaar number, or inthe case of a child to whom no Aadhaar
number has been assigned, producing an appilication for enrolment.”.

3. In section 4 of the principal Act, for sub-section (3), the following sub- Amendment of
sections shall be substituted, namely.— section 4.

“{3) Every Aadhaar number holder to establish his identity, may
voluntarily use his Aadhaar number in physical or electronic form by way
of authentication or offline verification, or in such other form as may be

notified, in such manner as may be specified by regulations.

Explanation.— For the purposes of this section, voluntary use of the
Aadhaar number by way of authentication means the use of such Aadhaar
number only with the informed consent of the Aadhaar number holder.

(4) An entity may be allowed to perform authentication, if the
Authority is satisfied that the requesting entity is—

(a) compliant with such standards of privacy and security as may
be specified by regulations; and

(0) (i) permitted to offer authentication services under the
provisions of any other law made by Parliament; or

(3#) seeking authentication for such purpose, as the Central
Government in consultation with the Authority, and in the interest of
State, may prescribe.

(5) The Authority may, by regulations, decide whether a requesting
entity shall be permitted the use of the actual Aadhaar number during
authentication or only an alternative virtual identity.

(6) Every requesting entity to whom an authentication request is made
by an Aadhaar number holder under sub-section (3) shall inform to the
Aadhaar number holder of aiternate and viable means of identification and
shall not deny any service to him for refusing to, or being unable to, undergo
authentication,

(7} Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions,
mandatory authentication of an Aadhaar number holder for the provision of




abcaus.in

Amendment of
section 8.

[nsertion of new
section KA.

Offline
verification of

Aadhaar number.

THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [PART [I—

any service shall take place if such authentication is required by a law made
by Parliament.”.

6. In section 8 of the principal Act,—
(@) in sub-section {2),—

(i) 1n clause (@), after the words “consent of an individual”, the
words “, or in the case of a child obtain the consent of his parent or
guardian” shall be inserted;

(i) after clause (b), the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely—

“Provided that the requesting entity shail, in case of failure to
authenticate due to illness, injury or infirmity owing to old age or
otherwise or any technical or other reasons, provide such alternate
and viable means of identification of the individual, as may be
specified by regulations.”;

(b) in sub-section (3), after the words “for authentication,”, the words
“or in the case of a child, his parent or guardian” shall be inserted.

7. After section 8 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
inserted, namely:—

“8A.(/) Every oflline venification of an Aadhaar number holder shall
be performed in accordance with the provisions of this section.

(2) Every offline verification-seeking entity shall,—

(@) before performing offline verification, obtain the consent of an
individual, or in the case of a child, his parent or guardian, in such
manner as may be specified by regulations; and

(b) ensure that the demographic information or any other
information collected from the individual for offline verification is
only used for the purpose of such verification.

(3) An offline verification-secking entity shall inform the individual
undergoing offline verification, or in the case of a child, his parent or

guarchan the following detalls with respect to offline verification, in such
manner as may be specified by regulations, namely.—

(a) the nature of information that may be shared upon offline
verification;

(b) the uses to which the information received during offline
verification may be put by the offline verification-seeking entity: and

(c) alternatives to submission of information requested for, if any.
(4) No offline venification-seeking entity shall—

(a) subject an Aadhaar number holder to authentication;




abcaus.in

SEC. 1] THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

(b) collect, use, or store an Aadhaar number or biometric
information of any individual for any purpose;

{¢) take any action contrary to any obligation on it as may be
specified by regulations.”.

8. For section 21 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely:—

“21.(1) The Authority shall appoint such officers and employees as
may be required for the discharge of its functions under this Act.

(2) The salaries and allowances payable to, and the other terms and
conditions of service of, the officers and employees of the Authority shall
be such as may be specified by regulations.”.

9. After section 23 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
~ inserted, namely,—

“23A.(/) The Authority may for the discharge of its functions under
this Act, or any rules or regulations made thereunder, by order, issue such
directions from fime to time to any entity in the Aadhaar ecosystem, as it
may consider necessary.

(2) Every direction issued under sub-section (/) shall be complied with
by the entity in the Aadhaar ecosystem to whom such direction is issued.”.

10. For section 25 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
substituted, namely:—

“25.(1) There shall be constituted a Fund to be called the Unique
Identification Authority of India Fund and there shall be credited thereto—

(a) all grants, fees and charges received by the Authority under
this Act; and

(b) ali sums received by the Authority from such other sources as
may be decided upon by the Central Government.

(2) The Fund shall be applied for meeting—

{@) the salaries and allowances payable to the Chairperson and
members and administrative expenses including the salaries,
allowances and pension payable to or in respect of officers and other
employees of the Authority; and

(b) the expenses on objects and for purposes authorised by this
Act”.

11. In section 29 of the principal Act,—

(a) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be suf:stituted,
namely:—

“(3) No identity information available with a requesting entity or

oftline verification-seeking entity shall be—

Substitvhion of
new section for
section 21.

Officers and other
employees of

Anthority.

Insertion of new
section 23A.

Power of Authority
to issue directions.

Substitution of
new section for
section 23.

Fund.

Amendment of
section 29,



abcaus.in

6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [PART [T

(2) used for any purpose, other than the purposes informed
in writing to the individual at the time of submitting any
information for authentication or ofthine verification; or

(b) disclosed for any purpose, other than purposes informed
in writing to the individual at the time of submitting any
information for authentication or offline verification:

Provided that the purposes under clauses (@) and (5) shall be in
clear and precise language understandable to the individual ”,

{5) 1n sub-section {{), for the wards “or core biometric information”, the
words “, demographic information or photograph™ shall be substituted.

Amendment of 12. In section 33 of the principal Act,—
section 33.

(7) in sub-section {/),—

(a) for the words “District Judge™, the words “Judge of a High
Court” shall be substituted;

(&) in the proviso, after the words “hearing to the Authority™, the
words “and the concerned Aadhaar number holder” shall be inserted;

(c) after the proviso, the following provise shall be inserted,
namely:—

“Provided further that the core bicmetnc information shall
not be disclosed under this sub-section.”.

(1) 1n sub-section (2), for the words “Joint Secretary”, the word
“Secretary™ shall be substituted.

Insertion of new 13, After Chapter VI of the principal Act, the following Chapter shall be
Chapter V1A, inserted, namely.— '
“CHAPTER VIA
CIVIL PENALTIES

Penalty for failure 33A.(/) Where an entity in the Aadhaar ecosystem fails to comply with
“:::i':iﬂ:fs‘;;iis the provision of this Act, the tules or regulations made thereunder or
ict' rules, directions issued by the Authority under section 23 A, or fails to furnish any
regulations and information, document, or return of report required by the Authority, such
directions.

entity shall be liable to a civil penalty which may extend to one crore rupees
for each contravention and in case of a continuing failure, with additional

penalty which may extend to ten lakh rupees for every day during which the
failure continues after the first contravention,

(2) The amount of any penalty imposed under this section, if not paid,
may be recovered as if it were an arrear of land revenue.

Power 10 33B.(]) For the purposes of adjudication under section 33A -and

adjudicate. imposing a penalty thereunder, the Authority shall appoint an officer of the
Authority, who is not below the rank of a Joint Secretary to the Government

of India and possessing such qualification and experience as may be



abcaus.in

24 of 1997.

SEeC, 1]

THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY

prescribed, to be an Adjudicating Officer for holding an inquiry in such
manner as may be prescribed.

{Z) No inquiry under sub-section (/) shall be initiated except by 2
complaint made by the Authority.

(3) While holding an inquiry, the Adjudicating Officer shall—

(@) provide the entity in the Aadhaar ecosystem against whom
complaint is made, an opportunity of being heard;

(b) have the power to summon and enforce the attendance of any
person acquainted with the facts and circumstances of the case o give
¢vidence or to produce any document which, in the opinion of the
Adjudicating Officer, may be useful for or relevant to the subject
matter of the inquiry.

(4) If the Adjudicating Officer, on such inquiry, is satisfied that the
entity tn the Aadhaar ecosystem has failed to comply with any provision of
this Act or the rules or regulations made thereunder or directions issued by
the Authonty under section 23A, or has failed to furnish any information,
document, or return of report required by the Authority, the Adjudicating

Officer may, by order, impose such penalty under section 33A as he thinks
fit,

33C.(J) The Telecom Disputes Settlement and Appellate Tribunal
established under section 14 of the Telecom Regulatory Authority of India
Act, 1997, shall be Appellate Tribunal for the purposes of hearing appeals
against the decision of the Adjudicating Officer under this Act.

(2) A person or entity in the Aadhaar ecosystem aggrieved by an order
of the Adjudicating Officer under section 33B, may prefer an appeal to the
Appellate Tribunal within a period of forty-five days from the date of

recelpt of the order appealed against, in such form and manner and
accompanied with such fee as may be prescribed:

Provided that the Appellate Tribunal may entertain an appeal after the

expiry of the said period of forty-five days if it is satisfied that there was
sufficient cause for not filing it within that period.

(3) On receipt of an appeal under sub-section (2), the Appellate
Tnbunal may, after giving the parties to the appeal an opportunity of being
heard, pass such orders thereon as it thinks fit, confirming, modifying or
setting aside the order appealed against.

(4) The Appellate Tribunal shall send a copy of every order made by it
to the parties to the appeal and to the Adjudicating Officer.

() Any appeal filed under sub-section (2) shall be dealt with by the
Appellate Tribural as expeditiously as possible and every endeavour shall
be made by it to dispose of the appeal within six months from the date on
which it is presented to it.

Appeals to

Appellate
Tribunal.



abcaus.in

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY

[PART II—

Procedure and
powers of the

Appeliate
Tribenal.

Appeal to

Supreme Court of
India.

Civil court not i
have jurisdiction.

Amendmens of
section 38,

Amendment of
section 39,

Substitution of
new section for
section 40,

Penalty for
unauthorised use
by requesting
entity or offline
verification-
seeking entity,

(6) The Appellate Tribunal may, for the purpose of deciding an appeal
before it, call for the records relevant to disposing of such appeal and make
such orders as it thinks fit.

33D. The provisions of sections 14-I to 14K (both inclusive), 16 and
17 of the Telecom Regulatory Authority of India Act, 1997 shall, mutatis
mutandis, apply to the Appellate Tribunal in the discharge of its functions

under this Act, as they apply to it in the discharge of its functions under that
Act.

33E. (I} Notwithstanding anything contained in the Code of Civil
Procedure, 1908 or in any other law for the time being in force, an appeal
shall lie against any order, not being an interlocutory order, of the Appellate
Tnibunal to the Supreme Court on any substantial question of law arising
out of such order.

(Z) No appeal shall lie against any decision or order made by the
Appellate Tribunal which the parties have consented to.

(3) Every appeal under this section shall be preferred within a period
of forty-five days from the date of the decision or order appealed against:

Provided that the Supreme Court may entertain an appeal afier the

expiry of the said period of forty-five days if it is satisfied that there was
sufficient cause for not filing it within that period.

33F. No civil court shall have jurisdiction to entertain any suit or
proceeding in respect of any matter which an Adjudicating Officer
appointed under this Act or the Appellate Tribunal is empowered, by or
under this Act to determine, and no injunction shall be granted by any court
or other authority in respect of any action taken or to be taken in pursuance
of any power conferred by or under this Act.”,

14. In section 38 of the principal Act, for the words “three years”, the words

“ten years” shall be substituted.

135. In section 39 of the principal Act, for the words “three years”, the words

“ten years” shall be substituted.

16. For section 40 of the principal Act, the following section shall be

substituted, namely:—

“40. Whoever,—

(a) being a requesting entity, uses the identity information of an
individual in contravention of sub-section (2) of section 8; or

(b) being an offline verification-seeking entity, uses the identity
information of an individval in contravention of sub-section (2) of
section 8A,

shail be punishable with imprisonment which may extend to three yearé. or
with a fine which may extend to ten thousand rupees or, in the case of a
company, with a fine which may extend to one lakh rupees or with both.”.

24 of 1997,

5 of 1908.




abcaus.in

43 of 1361,

Sc. 1]

THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY

17, In section 42 of the principal Act, for the words “one year”, the words

“three years” shall be substituted.

18. In section 47 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), the fotlowing
proviso shall be inserted, namely,—

“Provided that the court may, on a complaint made by an Aadhaar
number holder or individual take cognizance of any offence punishable
under section 34 or 35 or 36 or 37 or 40 or section 41.”.

19. Afler section S50 of the principal Act, the following section shall be
inserted, namely:—

“30A. Notwithstanding anything contained in the Income Tax Act,
1961 or any other enactment for the time being in force relating to tax on
income, profits or gains, the Authonty shall not be liable to pay income tax
or any other tax in respect of its income, profits or gains.”.

20. In section 51 of the principal Act, for the words “Member, officer”, the
words “Member or officer” shall be substituted.

21. In section 53 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),—
() after clause (a), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(aa) the purpose for which the requesting entity may be allowed
by the Authority to perform authentication under sub-clause (i) of
clause (&) of sub-section {4) of section 4::

(ii) after clause (g), the following clauses shall be inserted, nameiy:—

“(ga) the qualification and experience of, and the manner of
appoiniment of, the Adjudicating Officer under sub-section (I } of
section 33B;

(g0) the form, manner, and fee for an appeal to be filed under
sub-section (2) of section 33"

22. In section 54 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),
(i) for clause (a), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(a) the entities or group of entities in the Aadhaar ecosystem
under clause (ag), the biometric information under ¢lause {g) and the
demographic information under clause (%), the process of collecting
demographic information and biometric information from the
individuals by enrolling agencies under clause (m), and the modes of
offline verification of Aadhaar number holder under clause (pa) of
section 2"

(#7) after clause (), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(ba) the manner of generating alternative virtual identity under
sub-section (£) of section 3;

(&) the manner in which cancellation of an Aadhaar number may
be carried out under sub-section (2) of section 3A.”:

Amendment of
section 42,

Amendment of
section 47.

Lnsertion of new
section 50A.

Exemption from
tax on Income,

Amendment of
section 51.

Amendment of
section 53,

Amendment of
section 54.




abcaus.in

Omission of
section 57,

Amendment of
section 4 of Act

13 of 1885,

10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [PART [I—

(i) after clause {¢), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(ca) standards of privacy and security to be comptied with by the
requesting entities under sub-section (4) of section 4;

(cb) the classification of requesting entities under sub-section (5)
of section 4;";

(iv) after clause (f), the tollowing clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“{fa) the alternate and viable means of identification of individual
under the proviso to clause () of sub-section {2} of section 8;

(/b) the manner of obtaining consent under clause (@) of
sub-section {2}, the manner of providing informatien to the individual
undergoing offline verification under sub-section (3), and the
obligations of offline verification-seeking entities under clause (¢} of
sub-section (£), of section 8A;”.

23. Section 57 of the principal Act shall be omitted.

PART I1
AMENDMENT TO THE INDIAN TELEGRAPH ACT, 1885

24. In section 4 of the Indian Telegraph Act, 1885, after sub-section (2), the
following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely.—

‘(3) Any person who is granted a license under the first proviso to
sub-section (/) to establish, maintain or work a telegraph within any part of
India, shall identify any person to whom it provides its services by—

(z) authentication under the Aadhaar (Targeted Delivery of
Financial and Other Subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act, 2016; or

(b) offline verification under the Aadhaar (Targeted Delivery of
Financial and Other Subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act, 2016; or

(c) use of passport issued under section 4 of the Passports
Act, 1967; or

(d) use of any other officially valid document or modes of

identification as may be notified by the Central Government n this
behalf.

(4) If any person who is granted a license under the first proviso to
sub-section (/) to establish, maintain or work a telegraph within any part of
India is using authentication under clause (@) of sub-section (3) to identify
any person to whom it provides its services, it shall make the other modes
of identification under clauses {b) to (&) of sub-section (3) also available to
such person.

(3) The use of modes of identafication under sub-section (3) shé]l bea
voluntary choice of the person who is sought to be identified and no person
shall be denied any service for not having an Aadhaar number.

18 of 2016,

18 of 2016.

15 of 1947.




abcaus.in

SEC. 1]

THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY

11

18 of 20114.

15 of 2002.

18 of 2016.

15 of 2016.

15 of 1967.

18 of 2016.

(6) I, for identification of a person, authentication under clause (4} of
sub-sectiont (3) is used, neither his core biometric information nor the
Aadhaar number of the person shall be stored.

(7) Nothing contained in sub-sections (3), (4) and {5) shall prevent the
Central Government from specifying further safeguards and conditions for
compliance by any person who is granted a license under the first proviso
to sub-section (1) in respect of identification of person to whom it prﬂwdes
18 Services.

Explanation—The expressions “Aadhaar number” and “core
biometric information™ shall have the same meanings as arc respectively

assigned to them in clauses (a) and (7) of section 2 of the Aadhaar (Targeted

Delivery of Financial and Other Subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act,
2016.".

PART [V

AMENDMENT TO THE PREVENTION OF MONEY-LAUNDERING ACT, 2002

25. In chapter IV of the Prevention of Money-laundering Act, 2002

(hereafier in this Part, referred to as the principal Act), before section 12, the
following section shall be inserted, namely:— -

‘11A. (1) Every Reporting Entity shall verify the identity of its clients
and the beneficial owner, by—

(a) authentication under the Aadhezar (Targeted Delivery of
Financial and Other Subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act, 2016 if the

reporting enfity is a banking company; or

(b) offline verification under the Aadhaar (Targeted Delivery of
Financial and Other Subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act, 2016; or

(c) use of passport issued under section 4 of the Passports
Act, 1967; or

(d) use of any other officially valid document or modes of
identification as may be notified by the Central Government in this
behalf:

Provided that the Central Government may, if satisfied that a reporting
entity other than banking company, complies with such standards of privacy
and security under the Aadhaar (Targeted Delivery of Financial and Other
Subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act, 2016, and it is necessary and
expedient to do so, by notification, permit such entity to perform
authentication under clause {a):

Provided further that no notification under the first proviso shall be
1ssued without consultation with the Unique Identification Authority of
India established under sub-section (/) of section i1 of the -Aadhaar

(Targeted Delivery of Financial and Other Subsidies, Benefits and Services)
Act, 2016 and the appropriate regulator.

Insertion of new
section 1A,

. Verification of

1dentity by
Reporting Entity,

18 of 2014



abcaus.in

12 THE GAZETTE OF INDIAEXTRAORDINARY [PArT I

(2) If any reporting entity performs authentication under clause {a) of
sub-section (7), to verify the identity of its client or the beneficial owner it
shall make the other modes of identification under clauses (b), (c) and (d)

of sub-section () also available to such client or the beneficial owner.

(3) The use of medes of identification under sub-section (/) shall be a
voluntary choice of every client or beneficial owner who is sought to be
identified and no client or beneficial owner shall be denied services for not
having an Aadhaar number.

(4) i, for identification of a client or beneficial owner, authentication
or offline verification under clause {a) or clause (b) of sub-section (1) is
used, neither his core biometric information nor his Aadhaar number shall
be stored.

(5} Nothing in this section shall prevent the Central Government from
notifying additional safeguards on any reporting entity in respect of
verification of the identity of its ¢lient or beneficial owner.

Explanation— The expressions “Aadhaar number” and ‘“core
biometric information” shall have the same meanings as are respectively

assigned to them in clauses (@) and (f) of section 2 of the Aadhaar (Targeted
Delivery of Financial and Other Subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act,

2016 | - 18 of 2016,
Amendment of 26. In section 12 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), clauses (¢) and (4)
section 12. shall be omitted.
Amenduient of 27. In section 73 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), clauses (7} and (jf)
section 73. shall be omitted.
RAM NATHRKOVIND,
President.

DR. G. NARAYANA RAJU,
Secretary to the Govt. of India.

UPLOADED BY THE MANAGER, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA PRESS, MINTO ROAD, NEW DELHI-110002
AND PUBLISHED BY THE CONTROLLER OF PUBLICATIONS, DELHI-110034.

MGIPMRND—3993GI{CRC)—02-03-2018.

\\\\\\\\\\
AAAAAAAAAAAA




