File No.EDLI/Committee-Exem./Extension/2019
www.abcaus.In

FHATI wfAgd W "dasq
EMPLOYEES’ PROVIDENT FUND ORGANISATION
MINISTRY OF LABOUR & EMPLOYMENT, GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
7aa #4799/ Head Office
Stgua [\ 59+, 1, SFwAT FEHT 99, 98 SEE-110066
Bhavishya Nidhi Bhawan, 14, Bhikaiji Cama Place, New Delhi-110066

Website: www.epfindia.gov.in, www.epfindia.nic.in

E-File No: 27058 Date:29.04.2021

To,
All ACC (Zones)
All RPFC (in Charge of ROs)

Subject: Gazette Notification No.GSR 299(E) dated 28.04.2021 - Reg.
Madam/Sir,

Please find enclosed a copy of above mentioned notification issued by the
Ministry of Labour & Employment amending the Employees' Deposit-Linked
Insurance Scheme, 1976.

2. The said notification provides for the following :

(i) The maximum assurance benefit payable under paragraph 22(3) of EDLI
Scheme has been enhanced to Rs. 7 lakh from earlier maximum benefit of Rs.6
lakh (Under para 22(3) of the scheme, the salary multiple shall be 35).

(ii) The minimum assurance benefit payable under paragraph 22(3) of the EDLI
Scheme has been fixed as Rs.2.50 lakh w.e.f. 15.02.2020 (i.e. with effect from
the date of lapse of said benefit).

(iii) The benefit payable under paragraph 22(3) of EDLI Scheme shall be
extended to such beneficiaries where the deceased employee was a member of
the Fund or a provident fund exempted under Section 17 of the EPF & MP Act and
was in employment for a continuous period of 12 months preceding the month in
which he died, irrespective of change of establishment during the said period.

(iv) Under paragraph 28(4) of EDLI Scheme, the power to grant exemption to a
class of employees from the provisions of the scheme has been delegated to ACC
(Zone).

(v) The monetary fine payable under paragraph 29 of EDLI Scheme has been
enhanced to Rs.25,000.

3. The provisions as mentioned in sub-paragraph (i), (ii) & (iii) above shall
remain in force for a period of three years from their date of publication in the
Official Gazette.



File No.EDLI/Committee-Exem./Extension/2019
www.abcaus.In

4. It is requested to bring above scheme amendments to the notice of all
employers as well as employees covered under your jurisdiction through
appropriate modes of publicity.

5. It also intimated that all such proposals for grant of exemption from EDLI
Scheme, 1976 that may have been forwarded to this office are required to be re-
examined by concerned offices in light of above amendment for further n.a. In
the pending exemption proposals where the establishment may have sought
exemption for a "class of employees", where such class may be regular
employees of the establishment or any other such defined class, appropriate
action for grant of exemption may be taken in accordance with relevant
directions issued from time to time.

(This issues with the approval of ACC(HQ)(Pension))

Yours sincerely,
g-pr'l‘ = T

[Kartikey Singh]
Regional PF Commissioner-l (Pension)
Copy to:
1. RPFC-I (IS) for requisite changes in the application software at earliest.
2. RPFC-I (NDC) with request for web upload.
3. DD (OL) with request for Hindi version.



' 161
180245/20¥ )} ;@b caus.in

TR &, .- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

1.3, -31.Ue.-31.-29042021-226788
CG-DL-E-29042021-226788

STETYTIOT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT II—ETS 3—39-99% (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

TR & TSI
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 241] 7% faeefl, geeufaam, stiar 29, 2021/3T@ 9, 1943
No. 241] NEW DELHI, THURSDAY, APRIL 29, 2021/VAISAKHA 9, 1943

S 3 TSI HATAT
I Ll
75 faeedt, 28 arder, 2021

ar.#.f7. 299(37).—F =T AT, FHATT Aiaey e o whiot suay sfafaem, 1952 (1952 1
19) T &Y 7 i ITETT (1) & FTT 5T =T 67 T Tacd Fadi w1 TN FLd g0 FHART [HaAT
qgaE o 19T 61H, 1976 FT 3T Gerred wed & o A feriea =6 aerdr g, 37 -

1. (1) =0 ThH FT Giereq a9 FHATT T agag ST (Ferred) TR, 2021 |

(2) T T 2 F @ (@) F ITEE (iv) F ST 15 AT, 2020 F Ygeq gl qawAT S, FHEr ae= §
IE TR %l ATE Bl g gl |

2. FHATT &7 ggag |7 Thid, 1976 (S8 =98 38 T99Tq 37 Th1H Fgl AT &) # 927 22 & 3T-97
(3) ¥, -

(F) STEEF T & “Ueh g1 TITIAT | TS H AT 9] & T I¥ “THier § A7 oreg T S0,
(@) @< (i) &, -

(i) “< T IO QT&aT & T 9T “GATed g U 68 T ST,

(ii) “=rT SEERT Fawrar it srafer, S oft w9 g1 asat w1 AT AT ST,

2420 G1/2021 (1)



162

180245/20¥Y )y ;@bcaus.in
2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(iii) “TF AT THATH T FTA” 9T5a1 o T T “UF ATE Tagcd? g &9 9768 TG STUT;

(iv) T TLqF & Tge Mol red Tiqeh - eATiad oRaT ST, T 15 weasr, 2020 | s T
AT FHAT STTUAT, AT -

“Oi ST THAET &7 ATE TATE g9 &09 F FiF Tal gl

(V) T T H, “Bg ATG T9H” Qa1 o ST I¥ “}1q A1 €94 968 T ST |

3. IFT Th¥ & IT 28 * IT-IT (4) F @< (i) H, “FerT Atasy [ srqaa” st & qeanq AT At
FE ey At sraa (qeaTerd) A7 Afaiad Furd Siaey [t s sz 37 Fsss . eniuq &y
STTUAT |

4, IFT ThI o G 29 T ZTE GHid |, “ATY AT 97 9TE&1 & T U2 “T=A 16 g ¥ 293” 9058 T
ST |

5. T R F 97 22 F I7-977 (3) H U U werraw & gatad 3w why F 97 (2) F U« oH S &
TSI | YT il A & i a9 shl STatd o o Jged g |

[®T. €. 32-16011/1/2020-T&0H-11]

AT, . I[eaT, ST A9

feroqur ;. =T MET ggag ST w1976 A F TSI, SHTETr, 9 10, 9 3, IuEe (i) §
q1.%1. 1. dEaiE 488(3), TG 28 TS, 1976 FTRT THITAT il e AT 3T ITHT AT Ferrad syfe==r
e 91,7, 286 (1), AT 4 375<t, 2019 T AT 13T o7 |

T HTE AT

AT & &9, FATIR, AW 1, @< 3, 3@ (i), a@ 15 ®aid, 2018 § Sfe@=r aedi®
araEL|. 170(37), I 15 Fadt, 2018 T THMT AT TR F 97 3T TSR HATAT il
STErE=AT g =Aa | AT ST it sttt AT v &1 av i srafer F oy ggree &1 9 1= g = e
Y T F3>T AT AT, ST 14 wXFT, 2020 FT A gl e o oo 3aq yqiadT #7 Faear a9 F3d

F YA F T =9 geree =6 % 97 2 ¥ @ (@) % IUET (iv) F 15 FEasr, 2020 F It 9T
& T g, S et =ta & At 9 aiasge s9ma 951 ST

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 28th April, 2021

G.S.R. 299(E).—In exercise of the powers conferred by section 6C read with sub-section (1) of section 7 of the
Employees' Provident Funds and Miscellaneous Provisions Act, 1952 (19 of 1952), the Central Government hereby
makes the following Scheme further to amend the Employees' Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976, namely:—

1. (1) This Scheme may be called the Employees' Deposit-Linked Insurance (Amendment) Scheme, 2021.

(2) It shall come into force on the date of its publication in the Official Gazette, except sub-clause (iv) of clause (b) of
paragraph 2, which shall be deemed to have come into force on the 15™ day of February, 2020.

2. In the Employees' Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976 (hereinafter referred to as the said Scheme), in paragraph
22, in sub-paragraph (3),—

(a) in the opening portion, for the words “who was in employment of the same establishment”, the words “and
was in employment” shall be substituted;



' 163
180245/20¥ )}y ;@b caus.in

[\ 1I—E0E 3(i)] HTT T TS ETLTI0T 3

(b) in clause (i),—
(1) for the words “thirty times”, the words “thirty-five times” shall be substituted;
(i1) the words “or during the period of his membership, whichever is less” shall be omitted;

(iii) for the words “one lakh and fifty thousand rupees”, the words “one lakh and seventy-five thousand
rupees” shall be substituted;

(iv) before the second proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have been
inserted with effect from the 15™ day of February, 2020, namely:—

“Provided that the assurance benefit shall not be less than two lakh and fifty thousand rupees:”;

(v) in the second proviso, for the words “six lakh rupees”, the words “seven lakh rupees” shall be
substituted.

3. In the said Scheme, in paragraph 28, in sub-paragraph (4), in clause (i), after the words “Central Provident Fund
Commissioner”, the words and brackets “or Additional Central Provident Commissioner (Head Quarters) or Additional
Central Provident Fund Commissioner” shall be inserted.

4. In the said Scheme, in paragraph 29, in the long line, for the words “four thousand rupees”, the words “twenty-five
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

5. The provisions of paragraph 2 of this Scheme relating to amendments made thereto in sub-paragraph (3) of paragraph
22 of the said Scheme shall be in force for a period of three years with effect from the date of publication this Scheme
in the Official Gazette.

[F. No. R-16011/1/2020-SS-1I]
R. K. GUPTA, Jt. Secy.

Note:— The Employees' Deposit-Linked Insurance Scheme, 1976 was published in the Gazette of India,
Extraordinary, Part II, section 3, sub-section (i) vide number G.S.R. 488(E), dated the 28" July, 1976 and was last
amended vide notification number G.S.R. 286(E), dated the 4™ April, 2019.

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM

Vide the notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of Labour and Employment number G.S.R. 170(E),
dated the 15" F ebruary, 2018 published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, section 3, sub-section (i), dated
the 15™ February, 2018, the minimum assurance benefit ceiling was increased to two lakh and fifty thousand rupees for
a period of two years, which expired on the 14™ February, 2020. Therefore, for the purpose of giving continuity to the
said benefit, sub-clause (iv) of clause (b) of paragraph 2 of this amendment Scheme is given effect to retrospectively
from the 15" day of February, 2020, which will not adversely affect the interests of any person.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-1 10064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. MANO) KUMARS




www.abcaus.in

TRt |, S1.ae.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

1.3, -81.Ue.-37.-03052021-226823
CG-DL-E-03052021-226823

YT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT [I—EvE 3—39-TUE (i)
PART II—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

UFERTE & THTIA
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 249] % fRoedt, TMUATR, 9% 3, 2021/39T9 13, 1943
No. 249] NEW DELHI, MONDAY, MAY 3, 2021/VAISAKHA 13, 1943

T TF VST HATAT
afea=
% faoett, 30 arder, 2021
AT FA. 315(3).—9d F TS, 9 11, § 3, 3UEE (i) ¥ e 29 i, 2021 FT Aferg=r

Tt A7 FT14.299 (31), aTrE 28 1ie, 2021 FRT THIIAT FHATRT RerT agag T (Forred) =
2021 % 97 2 & @2 (@) & SUEE (i) § “GqTe( 19 I oTsai o T 9¥ “G 19 IO o1 Ig SAT0)

[FT. &. 3MT-16011/1/2020-THUH-11]
Y. . T[T, HYaF qrea

2453 GI/2021

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-1 10064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. manoskumar

VERMA




